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All Savings Within Reach work must be performed by a Savings Within Reach Trade Ally and comply with Home Retrofit Specification Manual requirements.  

Incentives listed are paid to the trade ally. 

Energy Improvement Requirements Incentive 

Attic Insulation 
If R-11 or less, insulate to R-38. A UL-listed carbon monoxide detector must be 
installed when a combustion appliance exists in the home, garage or other 
attached space. 

$0.50 per square foot. 

Wall Insulation 
If R-4 or less, insulate to R-11, or fill cavity. A UL-listed carbon monoxide detector 
must be installed when a combustion appliance exists in the home, garage or 
other attached space. 

$0.50 per square foot. 

Floor Insulation 
If R-0, insulate to R-30, or fill cavity. A UL-listed carbon monoxide detector must 
be installed when a combustion appliance exists in the home, garage or other 
attached space. 

$0.40 per square foot.  

Ductless Heat Pump 
HSPF 9.0 or greater. Compressor must be inverter driven. Incentive only available 
for homes replacing electric resistance heat or electric furnace as primary heat 
source of home. 

$1000 per residential structure. 

Ducted Heat Pump 
HSPF of 8.5 or greater. Must replace electric resistance heat (baseboard, wall 
heaters, electric furnace) as primary heat source. Additional incentives are also 
available for installing new heat pump controls, see controls incentives below. 

$1000 

New Heat Pump 
Controls 

Can be combined with ducted heat pump incentive. Must be added to a new heat 
pump with electric furnace auxiliary heat. Heat pump must be primary heat 
source. Visit http://www.energytrust.org/heatpumpcontrols for eligible models and 
more information. Thermostat must be set to 35°F lockout or as close as possible. 
Cannot be combined with other controls incentives. 

$250 

https://insider.energytrust.org/wp-content/uploads/HES_WX_Manual.pdf
http://www.energytrust.org/heatpumpcontrols
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All Savings Within Reach work must be performed by a Savings Within Reach Trade Ally and comply with Home Retrofit Specification Manual requirements.  

Incentives listed are paid to the trade ally. 

Energy Improvement Requirements Incentive 

Existing Heat Pump 
Controls 

Must be added to an existing heat pump with electric furnace auxiliary heat. Heat 
pump must be primary heat source. Visit 
http://www.energytrust.org/heatpumpcontrols for eligible models and more 
information. Thermostat must be set to 35°F lockout or as close as possible. 
Cannot be combined with other controls incentives or ducted heat pump incentive. 

$250 

Gas Furnace 
90% AFUE or greater. Must be home’s primary heat source. A CO monitor is 
required on every floor with a bedroom. 

$550 

Heat Pump Water 
Heater Tier 3 

Eligible models must meet Northwest Energy Efficiency Alliance’s Advanced 
Water Hear Specification Tier 3 and replace an existing electric water heater to 
qualify for this cash incentive. 

$375 

Important Savings Within Reach Terms and Conditions: 

• Savings Within Reach is available for customers who meet eligibility requirements in the Form 310MIT: Verification of Income Qualification. 

• Savings Within Reach incentives are available for qualifying projects installed in owner-occupied single-family homes and owner-occupied manufactured homes with land ownership. 

• Details of this program, including incentives, are subject to change without notice. Updates will be communicated to participating contractors by mail or email. 

• Each Savings Within Reach incentive is available once per site. 

• Application must be submitted within 60 days of installation. 

 

https://insider.energytrust.org/wp-content/uploads/HES_WX_Manual.pdf
http://www.energytrust.org/heatpumpcontrols

